
 

  Committee of the Whole 
 
 
Meeting Date:  November 9, 2021    

Submitted by: Brent Kerwin, Administrator, Strathmere Lodge 

SUBJECT: MINISTRY OF LONG TERM CARE COMPLIANCE INSPECTION 
VISIT 

 

BACKGROUND: 

The Lodge received the Public Copy of its inspection report on October 21, 2021 
(attached). 

During the course of six (6) days (i.e., September 23-24, September 27-29 and October 
1), up to two (2) Compliance Inspectors from the Ministry of Long Term Care (“The 
Ministry”) visited The Lodge daily in order to conduct an inspection of The Lodge’s 
Infection Prevention and Control (IPAC) protocols, and four (4) “Critical Incidents” (2 
resident hospitalizations resulting from a fracture, 1 incident of resident-to-resident 
abuse, and 1 incident of a narcotic not delivered to The Lodge by its pharmacy 
provider), further to The Lodge’s submission of 4 Critical Incident Reports to the Ministry 
during the period May – September 2021. 

As per provincial Long Term Care Homes legislation, homes must file Critical Incident 
reports with The Ministry for various incidents, including: a report of abuse; a missing 
resident; a missing or unaccounted for controlled substance (e.g., narcotic); an 
unexpected or sudden death; or an incident causing injury to a resident (e.g., fall with 
fracture) requiring a hospital visit and resulting in a significant health status change. The 
Ministry will review/investigate such incident reports.  

Inspection reports are posted at The Lodge as required by provincial long term care 
homes legislation. Inspection reports are reviewed at meetings of The Lodge’s 
Residents’ Council and Family Council. The Ministry posts home inspection reports on 
its provincial Public Reporting website. 

ANALYSIS: 

The Lodge received a single finding of non-compliance to provincial long term care 
homes legislation for not strictly adhering to its policy on conducting Post-fall Head 



 

Injury Assessments, to be performed by staff at nine (9) regular intervals over the first 
48 hours following a resident fall (where a resident is witnessed to have hit his/her head, 
or may have hit his/her head as a result of an unwitnessed fall). 

Specifically, inspectors identified 2 resident falls where the 2 applicable residents were 
not awaken from their sleep in order to perform a head injury assessment (which 
includes taking vital signs and ensuring pupils are reactive) at the required interval. 

To minimize the possibility of a similar finding in the future, a member of the Nursing 
department will be assigned to regularly review all resident head injury assessment 
records to ensure that assessments are conducted/documented for all nine (9) intervals 
comprising a 48-hour head injury assessment routine. 
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